
16236801006 0.73
16236801007 0.49
16236801008 0.49
16236801009 0.50
16236801011 0.99
16236802009 0.46
16236802025 0.64
16327301011 2.99
16327301012 30.39

16332501010 4.77
16332501011 4.32
16332501017 7.90
16332501018 3.31
16332501020 1.24

16333101014 2.85
16333201009 2.70
16333201018 8.58
16333201019 2.64
16333501011 13.19
16333601001 23.16
16333601005 4.09

190.94 $83,365,000 $11,321,018.18
Revised 11/21/14

Sales 
Unit

Parcel Number (APN) Acres +/- Unit Fair Market Value
Winning Bid 

Amount

3 16327701002 8.93 $3,790,000 NO BID

16333201014 4.70 $2,000,000 NO BID

5 16333101004 14.01 $5,950,000 NO BID

8 16334501001 12.99 $5,520,000 NO BID

10 17610101006 18.21 $7,740,000 NO BID

17705610006 4.81 $4,610,000 $6,560,000.00

11 17702102030 0.76 $220,000 $222,000.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

Clark County Department of Aviation
Vacant Land Auction
November 18, 2014

AUCTION RESULTS

NO BID

NO BID

NO BIDNO BID

Winning Bidder

1

2

4

7 $24,300,000 

$9,150,000 

$14,180,000 

$1,405,000 

6

TOTAL

Bresee Development, Inc.

Dynamic Development Company II, LLC

Oreste Joseph Bruni

2700 Richmar LV, LLC15 17720701012 8.10 $4,230,000 $4,240,018.18

13 17709203002 2.00 $270,000 $299,000.00

12
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